

DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION	USER
5/1/2021	0.7	PC with team re complaint and service .6 Summary email to NHD. .1	David Sugerman
6/16/2021	0.5	Team meeting re discovery and litigation planning	David Sugerman
7/15/2021	0.5	Review draft interrogatories and RFP's and provide notes to team .5	David Sugerman
8/12/2021	1	Rule 26(f) conference (.5). Debrief with team (.5)	David Sugerman
12/14/2021	1.1	Initial call with mediator and all counsel .5 PC plaintiffs team to debrief and discuss mediation strategy. .6	David Sugerman
1/6/2022	9.5	Mediation	David Sugerman
1/6/2022	9.5	Mediation	Nadia Dahab
2/22/2022	0.5	Team meeting re settlement issues.	David Sugerman
11/29/2022	1	OnPoint prep call	David Sugerman
12/14/2022	1.1	Call w/counsel re MTD & discovery responses	Nadia Dahab
1/2/2023	1.88	Draft response to Rule 12 motions	Nadia Dahab
1/2/2023	3.16	Draft portion of response to Rule 12 motions.	Nadia Dahab
1/4/2023	0.59	Review response to motion to dismiss.	Nadia Dahab
1/6/2023	2.4	Review response to Rule 12 motions.	Nadia Dahab
1/6/2023	3.74	Finalize and file response in opposition to Rule 12 motions.	Nadia Dahab
1/26/2023	1.61	Pre-conferral call; conferral with defense re discovery.	Nadia Dahab
2/2/2023	3.2	Prepare for oral argument on Defendants MTD/MTS	Nadia Dahab
2/25/2023	0.23	Review Rule 12 motions.	Nadia Dahab
2/26/2023	3	Review briefs and Ramirez.	Nadia Dahab
3/1/2023	0.5	Granados: Hearing Prep Meeting	David Sugerman
3/1/2023	1	Oral Argument on Def's Motion to Dismiss and Motion to Strike (Granados, Jenna)	David Sugerman
3/1/2023	1	oral argument on Defendant's MTD/MTS	Nadia Dahab
3/7/2023	0.7	OnPoint - call re: discovery	David Sugerman
3/7/2023	0.63	Litigation team meeting	Nadia Dahab
3/9/2023	0.32	Review discovery deficiency letter.	Nadia Dahab

4/11/2023	0.4	Review and comment on revised draft schedule and ESI protocols. .4	David Sugerman
4/21/2023	0.2	Review draft initial disclosures and respond to Ryan email .2	David Sugerman
5/16/2023	0.9	Prep for conferral call (Def confer on RFA's and RFP's; P re ESI) (.2) Conferral call via teams with K McGair, K Johnson, and RTH .7	David Sugerman
6/23/2023	0.38	Conferral call with Ryan and OnPoint counsel.	Nadia Dahab
6/26/2023	1	Team meeting (zoom): discovery status and plan	David Sugerman
7/13/2023	1	Team meeting (zoom): discovery status and plan	Nadia Dahab
8/15/2023	3.21	Depo prep w/Jenna Granados	Nadia Dahab
8/21/2023	8	Prep & Depo of Jenna Granandos	Nadia Dahab
9/5/2023	1	Team meeting re def corr on discovery and mediation	David Sugerman
9/5/2023	1.15	Internal litigation team call	Nadia Dahab
9/7/2023	0.29	Conferral with counsel re discovery and depositions.	Nadia Dahab
9/8/2023	0.48	Draft joint motion to extend case deadlines.	Nadia Dahab
10/14/2023	1.93	Review documents in anticipation of depo	Nadia Dahab
10/14/2023	2.21	Review documents in anticipation of depo	Nadia Dahab
10/15/2023	2	Review documents in anticipation of depo.	Nadia Dahab
10/15/2023	0.65	Review documents in anticipation of depo	Nadia Dahab
10/15/2023	2	Review documents in anticipation of depo	Nadia Dahab
10/15/2023	1	Review documents in anticipation of depo	Nadia Dahab
10/16/2023	1	Review documents in anticipation of depo	Nadia Dahab
10/16/2023	1.39	Review documents and talk with Blythe re same in anticipation of depo.	Nadia Dahab

10/16/2023	0.43	review policy docs in anticipation of depo	Nadia Dahab
10/17/2023	9.5	Prepare for and take Sims deposition.	Nadia Dahab
10/18/2023	2	Review documents in anticipation of depo	Nadia Dahab
10/18/2023	1.3	Review documents in anticipation of depo	Nadia Dahab
10/19/2023	5.2	Review documents in anticipation of depo	Nadia Dahab
10/20/2023	3	Review documents and prepare for I. Celeste deposition.	Nadia Dahab
10/20/2023	5	Deposition of I. Celeste	Nadia Dahab
10/23/2023	1.8	Depo prep w/Cesar Granados	Nadia Dahab
11/6/2023	6	Depo of Cesar Granados	Nadia Dahab
11/7/2023	0.36	Call with Blythe re McJannett deposition.	Nadia Dahab
11/7/2023	4	Depo prep for F. McJannett	Nadia Dahab
11/8/2023	6	Deposition of F. McJannett	Nadia Dahab
11/13/2023	0.5	Team meeting re discovery extension, 30b6, and depo recap.	David Sugerman
11/14/2023	0.2	Review B Chandler email and draft of MOET discovery	David Sugerman
11/14/2023	1.5	Conferral with defense counsel; follow up call with Blythe.	Nadia Dahab
11/15/2023	1.5	Discovery conference w/judge	David Sugerman
11/15/2023	1.5	Discovery conference w/judge	Nadia Dahab
11/29/2023	1	conferral call w/ BC and NHD and def re plaintiffs' 30b6 1.0	David Sugerman
12/5/2023	1.05	Draft discovery conferral letter.	Nadia Dahab
12/5/2023	0.2	Draft letter re conferral and circulate internally.	Nadia Dahab
12/11/2023	0.27	Email to team re 30b6 topics.	Nadia Dahab
12/12/2023	0.5	Review Blythe emails; 30b6 notice; respond to Issac re topics.	Nadia Dahab
1/2/2024	1.52	Review Granados filings.	Nadia Dahab
3/2/2024	1.13	Prepare for 30b6 deposition.	Nadia Dahab
3/3/2024	3.13	Prepare for 30b6 deposition.	Nadia Dahab
3/4/2024	3.6	Prepare for 30b6 deposition.	Nadia Dahab
3/4/2024	1.99	Prepare for 30b6 deposition.	Nadia Dahab
3/5/2024	8	Take 30bc deposition of B. Volinsky	Nadia Dahab
3/6/2024	3	Prepare for 30b6 deposition.	Nadia Dahab

3/7/2024	4	Prepare for 30b6 deposition.	Nadia Dahab
3/8/2024	8	Take 30bc deposition of Laviolette	Nadia Dahab
3/12/2024	0.52	Prepare draft joint motion to stay.	Nadia Dahab
4/15/2024	0.2	Call with Blythe re discovery conferral.	Nadia Dahab
5/23/2024	0.3	Review and redline BC draft settlement letter	David Sugerman
5/28/2024	0.15	Review 408 letter and email team re same; email communication with Issac.	Nadia Dahab
5/28/2024	0.3	Call with Blythe re settlement letter.	Nadia Dahab
6/5/2024	0.99	Finalize and send ER 408 letter and class list to counsel.	Nadia Dahab
6/11/2024	0.17	Confer with Blythe and email with OC re mediation.	Nadia Dahab
6/12/2024	0.82	Call with Issac et al; f/u call with Blythe.	Nadia Dahab
7/9/2024	0.9	Review draft brief to mediator	Nadia Dahab
7/10/2024	0.8	Review final brief to mediator	Nadia Dahab
7/15/2024	1.1	Review mediation letters .3 and pre-mediation team call. .8	David Sugerman
7/15/2024	0.35	Draft and circulate joint status report.	Nadia Dahab
7/15/2024	1	Call w/team re mediation strategy	Nadia Dahab
7/17/2024	8	Mediation w/Valerie Egerton	David Sugerman
7/17/2024	8	Mediation w/Valerie Egerton	Nadia Dahab
8/19/2024	0.21	Call with Issac and Blythe.	Nadia Dahab
8/26/2024	0.5	Review and respond to B Chandler email .1 Begin review of draft settlement agreement .4	David Sugerman
8/28/2024	1.5	Complete initial review of draft settlement agreement	David Sugerman
8/29/2024	1.5	C w/ NHD re redline of settlement agreement .1 Complete redline of settlement agreement 1.2 Emails to team x2 .2	David Sugerman
9/3/2024	1.6	Begin drafting motion for preliminary approval 1.6	David Sugerman
9/4/2024	1.5	Continue drafting motion for preliminary approval 1.6	David Sugerman
9/5/2024	3.2	Continue drafting motion for preliminary approval	David Sugerman

9/6/2024	3.5	Continue and complete rough draft motion for preliminary approval 3.5	David Sugerman
9/8/2024	1.2	Read and revise motion for preliminary approval	David Sugerman
9/9/2024	1.5	Further revisions--timeline .8. C w/ HHR re production status .1 Circulate draft to team for comments .1 Integrate Dan's edits .5 Correct revisions to fix admin error 1.2 (N/C) Email defense team with draft and questions .1	David Sugerman
9/16/2024	0.5	Review K Johnson email .1 Email B Chandler re notice and review response .1 Review TM notice document drafts .2 Email to defense notice form drafts .1	David Sugerman
9/18/2024	0.3	Review corr re timing of settlement paperwork .1 Email team .1 Email defense .1	David Sugerman
9/26/2024	0.8	Review defendants' settlement documents/revisions (motion, preliminary approval order, final approval order) .5 Email to team .1 Review D. Schlanger revisions and response to email .1 PC B. Chandler .1	David Sugerman
10/4/2024	1.7	Further revisions on motion for preliminary approval. 1.2 Draft and revise DFS Dec .5	David Sugerman
10/8/2024	0.6	Review order from court on preliminary approval and notice .1 Email to team .1 Review BC's draft amendment and original settlement agreement .3 Respond with notes. .1	David Sugerman
2/4/2025	0.2	Review M. Unkefer email re electronic payment. Query team via email. Review responses. Respond to M. Unkefer .2	David Sugerman
2/5/2025	0.2	Review IFR script draft from admin and seek input/confirmation from team .(.2)	David Sugerman

2/10/2025	0.5	Confer with defense. Draft and circulate email to court re modification of notice and review response from court	David Sugerman
2/12/2025	0.33	Research re Simon fee awards.	Nadia Dahab
2/12/2025	0.59	Call with team re attorney fee motion.	Nadia Dahab

<b>DFS</b>	<b>53.9</b>	<b>\$798</b>	<b>\$43,012.20</b>
<b>NHD</b>	<b>158.36</b>	<b>\$567</b>	<b>\$89,790.12</b>
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>212.26</b>		<b>\$132,802.32</b>